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vE-jA is a global snapshot of an exploding genre of tech-art performance: VJing and live audio-video. The
book covers 40 international artists with 400+ colour images and 50+ movies and clips on an accompanying
DVD and web downloads. Regionally organized, the book showcases VJing and live A/V not as an isolated
art phenomenon for geeks, but as a global art movement with sophisticated creators and audiences alike. The
organization of the book in this manner has lead to discoveries of the differences and similarities in the
devlopment of the art including the influence of specific urban styles, political and social states, cultural
influences, as well as hardware and software development and influences in specific regions. Introductory
essay by Marius Watz brings forth the role of synchronicity of audio and video technology in cinematic
performances; Barry Munsterteiger, Interactive Media Group Senior Designer for Apple Inc., focuses on the
role of art in the evolution of technology; Grant Davis (VJ Culture) provides supportive information on VJ
specific hardware and software. In addition, essays by contributing artists cover local cultural aspects
influencing VJ scenes globally and provide insight on the inflluences and productivity of cities such as
London, Helsinki, Barcelona, Tokyo and general scenes of US, Austria, France, Netherlands and Australia.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Martz:

This vE-jA: Art + Technology of Live Audio-Video (Book, DVD & Downloads) (English and Japanese
Edition) are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The explanation of this vE-jA:
Art + Technology of Live Audio-Video (Book, DVD & Downloads) (English and Japanese Edition) can be
one of several great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but
feed you actually with information that possibly will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely
handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed types. Beside that
this vE-jA: Art + Technology of Live Audio-Video (Book, DVD & Downloads) (English and Japanese
Edition) giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical
thinking that we understand it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Willie Collier:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this vE-jA: Art + Technology of Live Audio-
Video (Book, DVD & Downloads) (English and Japanese Edition) publication written by well-known writer
who knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written in
good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you
still doubt vE-jA: Art + Technology of Live Audio-Video (Book, DVD & Downloads) (English and
Japanese Edition) as good book not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one reserve that can
break don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on
your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Harold Houston:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This guide vE-jA: Art + Technology of Live Audio-Video (Book, DVD & Downloads)
(English and Japanese Edition) was filled in relation to science. Spend your spare time to add your
knowledge about your science competence. Some people has several feel when they reading the book. If you
know how big selling point of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Harley Campbell:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
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