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Royal Bodyguard Hatter Madigan’s search takes an unexpected detour when he travels ‘within’ guided by a
mischievous and often maddening young girl named Nekko. Nekko’s origin is a Zen mystery, but her
devotion to Hatter’s quest to find the lost Princess is unwavering. After Nekko kidnaps his Hat and leads him
on a fearless chase across the rooftops of 1871 San Francisco, Hatter must acknowledge her as a teacher. It is
written that when you are ready the teacher will appear, but if the teacher is a 12-year-old girl and you are a
High Ranking Bladesman you may discover that all you can do is laugh.

Hatter and Nekko’s adventure around the ring of fire begins when they track a stolen samurai sword with a
Wonderland connection to San Francisco’s styling 19th century hiphop crime madam Missy Tong and her
eager protégé, the outspoken Lil’ Dick. A stowaway trip aboard a shanghai sailing ship ends on the Hawaiian
Islands where a surfboard becomes Hatter’s vehicle to illumination. And then on to Japan! Good grief it’s
Chikao and the gang, schoolhouse demons, cosplay, manga, noodles and a long lost brother from another
world. Duality? No. Milliners.”
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Jakubowski:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't need
do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Hatter M: Zen of Wonder. All type of
book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Kevin Miller:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have spare time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They need to answer that
question simply because just their can do in which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need this kind of Hatter M: Zen of
Wonder to read.

David Bruce:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Hatter M: Zen of Wonder is
our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Angela Latham:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for you is Hatter M: Zen of Wonder this book consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles
that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some analysis when he makes
this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.
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