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Grow in knowledge and understanding of God through His Word. The text of this New King James
Version® (NKJV) Bible is arranged in 365 portions, each including devotional insights derived from Dr.
Stanley's Life Principles Bible. The full text of the Bible is broken into daily readings so you can read the
Bible in a year. The daily 15-minute readings consist of a passage from the Old Testament, readings from
Psalms and Proverbs, and a New Testament passage. Notes from Dr. Stanley shed additional light on each
day's readings, and articles apply the Scriptures to our daily lives. This daily Bible is designed to bring more
focus and depth to the time spent in God's Word.

Features include:

NKJV text for daily reading●

Life Principles articles focusing on daily application●

Life Examples from the people of the Bible●

Answers to Life's Questions and What the Bible Says About articles●

Life Lessons that give insight into Scripture portions●

Part of the Signature Series line of Thomas Nelson Bibles.

Charles F. Stanley Life Principles Daily Bibles sold to date: More than 114,000

The New King James Version—More than 60 million copies sold in 30 years
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Burritt:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book entitled NKJV,
Charles F. Stanley Life Principles Daily Bible, Hardcover (Signature Series)? Maybe it is to get best activity
for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can better than before.
Do you agree with the opinion or you have different opinion?

Michelle Chase:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question because
just their can do this. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because start
from on pre-school until university need that NKJV, Charles F. Stanley Life Principles Daily Bible,
Hardcover (Signature Series) to read.

Henry Howell:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as
in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually NKJV, Charles F. Stanley Life Principles Daily Bible,
Hardcover (Signature Series) why because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not
disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Karen Saldivar:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was exactly
added. This e-book NKJV, Charles F. Stanley Life Principles Daily Bible, Hardcover (Signature Series) was
filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can truly feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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