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Introduce children to the wonders of nature with this beautiful guide to edible and non-edible plants. Each
page is a collage of full color photographs of each plant or weed to make identification in the real world
easy. Simple but clever rhymes are easy for children to recall to help remember if the plant is edible or toxic.
This book is a great primer for children, and the beautiful pages make it a reference book for years to follow.
Although based primarily in the northwest, this book covers over 20 prominent weeds, many of which, such
as dandelions and clover, can be found across the country. This book is a must have to teach children about
foraging wild food for fun or basic survival, or to prevent accidental poisoning.
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From reader reviews:

Josephine McIntire:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or
maybe exercise. Well, probably you'll have this My Wild Garden: An introduction to edible and non-edible
wild plants.

Connie Pauls:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book
that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy read one along
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual My Wild Garden: An introduction to
edible and non-edible wild plants is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Donna Young:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of various
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually
more imaginative. When you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people.
When you read this My Wild Garden: An introduction to edible and non-edible wild plants, it is possible to
tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make
them reading a publication.

Harold Thompson:

The guide with title My Wild Garden: An introduction to edible and non-edible wild plants includes a lot of
information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific
book exist new information the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world
now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring
you with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can
read the item anywhere you want.
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