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Nam June Paik (1932–2006) was one of the most innovative artists of the 20th century. His influence is still
felt in music, the visual arts, film, and video. 

Extensively illustrated, with extracts from interviews and reminiscences from many who were close to Paik
during his lifetime, this is the most thorough and illuminating exploration of Paik's legacy yet published. 

Born in South Korea, Paik began his career as a composer in Japan and in Germany, where he met John
Cage and collaborated with Joseph Beuys. Moving to New York in 1964, he formed relationships with a
number of artists associated with the Fluxus group, particularly the cellist Charlotte Moorman, who became
one of his closest collaborators. He continued to experiment in performance and video art, famously using
manipulated televisions as elements in sculptural works, creating robot sculptures and installations. 

An international range of contributors trace the course of Paik's life and career, exploring his connections
with key figures in the 20th-century avant-garde, his theoretical writings, and his lasting influence.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Benner:

The book Nam June Paik can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why
must we leave a very important thing like a book Nam June Paik? Several of you have a different opinion
about guide. But one aim in which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other;
you may share all of these. Book Nam June Paik has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and
big function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Jonas Jones:

This Nam June Paik book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you
have by reading this book is information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting
deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This particular Nam June Paik without we understand
teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't become worry Nam June
Paik can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because
you can have it inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Nam June Paik having great arrangement
in word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Raymond Dahms:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading routine give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based
on what kind of publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if
you want sense happy read one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Nam June
Paik is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Hoa Gilkey:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read is definitely Nam June Paik.
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