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A wonderfully witty, erudite, and insightful book about the way "things fall apart" -- about the inevitable
ruin of everything from bodies and works of art to ideals and whole societies

In The Way of All Flesh Midas Dekkers argues that things are at their most beautiful when they decay,
provided they are given the chance. Old buildings are usually pulled down or restored. Aging people
desperately try to act and look young, becuase novelty, youth and beauty are equated in our minds with what
is desirable. Only mankind is bothered by the realization that "life is a way of dying slowly." By ignoring or
evading the lure of decay, which has its own attractions, are we simply trying to escape from the truth?

With the idiosycratic erudition of the european intellectual -- Roberto Calasso
and Umberto Eco come to mind -- Dekkers stresses that our aversion to decay and mortality makes our lives
shallow. This is the meditative essay as written by Fellini; Dekkers that ancient Rome's days of decline were
its finest, and The Way of All Flesh is a profound and entertaining meditation on what it means to outlive
one's usefulness, when the wheel of fortune has gone full circle.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Wilhelm:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need
more time to be go through. The Way of All Flesh: The Romance of Ruins can be your answer since it can
be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Linda Mays:

The book untitled The Way of All Flesh: The Romance of Ruins contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains the woman idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all the
people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was authored by famous author. The
author brings you in the new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime.
In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it.
Have a nice read.

Mildred Brummett:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Way of All Flesh: The Romance of
Ruins can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your
spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than
the others?

Kevin Dobson:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By
book The Way of All Flesh: The Romance of Ruins we can get more advantage. Don't someone to be
creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that suited
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book The Way of All Flesh: The
Romance of Ruins. You can more desirable than now.
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