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This volume presents the first wide-ranging critical review of validity generalization (VG)--a method that
has dominated the field since the publication of Schmidt and Hunter's (1977) paper "Development of a
General Solution to the Problem of Validity Generalization." This paper and the work that followed had a
profound impact on the science and practice of applied psychology. The research suggests that fundamental
relationships among tests and criteria, and the constructs they represent are simpler and more regular than
they appear.

Looking at the history of the VG model and its impact on personnel psychology, top scholars and leading
researchers of the field review the accomplishments of the model, as well as the continuing controversies.
Several chapters significantly extend the maximum likelihood estimation with existing models for meta
analysis and VG. Reviewing 25 years of progress in the field, this volume shows how the model can be
extended and applied to new problems and domains. This book will be important to researchers and graduate
students in the areas of industrial organizational psychology and statistics.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Keller:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great along with important the book Validity
Generalization: A Critical Review (Applied Psychology Series). All type of book would you see on many
resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Robin Martz:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Validity Generalization: A Critical Review
(Applied Psychology Series) guide written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
that could be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking
every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty Validity
Generalization: A Critical Review (Applied Psychology Series) as good book not just by the cover but also
from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Sarah Maddocks:

The book untitled Validity Generalization: A Critical Review (Applied Psychology Series) contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward
all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous author.
The author will bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can read more your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go
through.

Kimberly Spradlin:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top record in your reading list will be Validity Generalization: A Critical Review (Applied Psychology
Series). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious
person. By looking up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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