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A dazzling new collection of stories from the critically acclaimed author of Stories for Nighttime and
Some for The Day
 
Ben Loory returns with a second collection of timeless tales, inviting us to enter his worlds of whimsical
fantasy, deep empathy, and playful humor, in the signature voice that drew readers to his highly praised first
collection. In stories that eschew literary realism, Loory’s characters demonstrate richly imagined and
surprising perspectives, whether they be dragons or swordsmen, star-crossed lovers or long-lost twins,
restaurateurs dreaming of Paris or cephalopods fixated on space travel. In propulsive language that brilliantly
showcases Loory’s vast imagination, Tales of Falling and Flying expands our understanding of how fiction
can work and is sure to cement his reputation as one of the most innovative short-story writers working
today.
 
Praise for Ben Loory’s Stories for Nighttime and Some for the Day:
 
“This guy can write!” —Ray Bradbury
 
“[A] wild, dreamy debut . . . These stories are full of wit, humor, and heart.” —The Boston Globe
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From reader reviews:

Henrietta Jimerson:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Tales of Falling
and Flying: Stories suitable to you? The actual book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Tales of Falling and Flying: Storiesis a single of several books that will everyone read now. That
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new
age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, consequently all of
people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a great deal of information
about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world with this book.

Lillian Carlucci:

Tales of Falling and Flying: Stories can be one of your starter books that are good idea. All of us recommend
that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place
every word into delight arrangement in writing Tales of Falling and Flying: Stories nevertheless doesn't
forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe
you can be considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of
crucial imagining.

James Drake:

This Tales of Falling and Flying: Stories is great e-book for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who have always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This
book reveal it data accurately using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences in it. So if you
are read the item hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward
sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Tales of Falling and
Flying: Stories in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one. We can
say that no guide that offer you world in ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this is
certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in which?

Nicole Floyd:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Tales of Falling and Flying: Stories or
maybe others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to
read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those books are
helping them to add their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any other book likes Tales of
Falling and Flying: Stories to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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