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A name synonymous with ground-breaking music, Tony Visconti has worked with the most dynamic and
influential names in pop, from T.Rex and Iggy Pop to David Bowie and U2. This is the compelling life story
of the man who helped shape music history, and gives a unique, first-hand insight into life in London during
the late 1960s and '70s.

This memoir takes you on a roller-coaster journey through the glory days of pop music, when men wore
sequins and pop could truly rock. Featuring behind-the-scenes stories of big names such as Bowie, Visconti's
unique access to the hottest talent, both on stage and off, for over five decades is complemented by unseen
photographs from his own personal archive, offering a glimpse at music history that few have witnessed so
intimately.

Soon after abandoning his native New York to pursue his musical career in the UK, Visconti was soon in the
thick of the emerging glam rock movement, launching T.Rex to commercial success and working with the
then-unknown David Bowie.

Since his fateful move to the land of tea and beer drunk straight from the can, Visconti has worked with such
names as T.Rex, Thin Lizzy, Wings, The Boomtown Rats, Marsha Hunt, Procol Harum, and more recently
Ziggy Marley, Mercury Rev, the Manic Street Preachers and Morrissey on his acclaimed new album
'Ringleader of the Tormentors'.

Even Visconti's personal life betrays an existence utterly immersed in music. Married to first to Siegrid
Berman, then to Mary Hopkin and later to May Pang, he counts many of the musicians and producers he has
worked with as close friends and is himself a celebrated musician.
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From reader reviews:

William Fugate:

Here thing why this Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy are different
and reputable to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content from it which is
the content is as delicious as food or not. Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the
Brooklyn Boy giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any publication out there but
there is no book that similar with Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy.
It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing which happened in the world
which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in
your means home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form
of Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy in e-book can be your choice.

Jerry Raminez:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie,
Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy, you could enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still wish to miss it?
What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
named reading friends.

Charles Ginter:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is known as of book
Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy. You'll be able to your knowledge
by it. Without making the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is
most important that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.

Marion Driskell:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Tony Visconti: The Autobiography:
Bowie, Bolan and the Brooklyn Boy to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of
reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read
it and mingle the impression about book and studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
open a book and read it. Beside that the guide Tony Visconti: The Autobiography: Bowie, Bolan and the
Brooklyn Boy can to be a newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information
must you're doing of this time.
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