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For courses in Biological Anthropology

Present a concise overview of biological anthropology, from early foundations to recent innovations
 Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials  combines concise coverage of the foundations of the
field with modern innovations and discoveries, helping students understand, and get excited about, the
discipline. Because the authors conduct research in three of the main areas of biological anthropology–the
human fossil record (Susan Antón), primate behavior and ecology (Craig Stanford), and human biology and
the brain (John Allen)–they offer a specialist approach that engages students and gives them everything they
need to master the subject. The Fourth Edition continues to present traditional physical anthropology within
a modern Darwinian framework, and includes coverage of contemporary discoveries to highlight the ever-
increasing body of knowledge in biological anthropology.

Also available with MyAnthroLab®

MyAnthroLab for the Biological Anthropology course extends learning online to engage students and
improve results. Media resources with assignments bring concepts to life, and offer students opportunities to
practice applying what they’ve learned. Please note: this version of MyAnthroLab does not include an eText.
 
Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials, Fourth Edition is also available via REVEL™, an
interactive learning environment that enables students to read, practice, and study in one continuous
experience.

Note: You are purchasing a standalone product; MyLab™ & Mastering™ does not come packaged with this
content. Students, if interested in purchasing this title with MyLab & Mastering, ask your instructor for the
correct package ISBN and Course ID. Instructors, contact your Pearson representative for more information.

If you would like to purchase both the physical text and MyLab & Mastering, search for:
0134377974 / 9780134377971  Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials plus MyAnthroLab
for Biological Anthropology — Access Card Package, 4/e
Package consists of:

0134014014 / 9780134014012  Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials, 4/e●

0134324404 / 9780134324401  MyAnthroLab for Biological Anthropology Access Card●
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Anderson:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel happy
read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Exploring Biological
Anthropology: The Essentials (4th Edition) is kind of book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Kurt Gomez:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a book. The book Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials (4th Edition) it doesn't matter
what good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You
can m0ore very easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book
provides high quality.

Robin Boucher:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Exploring Biological Anthropology: The
Essentials (4th Edition) reserve written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still uncertainty Exploring Biological
Anthropology: The Essentials (4th Edition) as good book not only by the cover but also from the content.
This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to
a different sixth sense.

Justin Tran:

This Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials (4th Edition) is great reserve for you because the
content which is full of information for you who have always deal with world and possess to make decision
every minute. That book reveal it data accurately using great plan word or we can claim no rambling
sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering
sentences. Having Exploring Biological Anthropology: The Essentials (4th Edition) in your hand like having



the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world
inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hello Mr. and
Mrs. active do you still doubt this?
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