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Examining the neurobiological underpinnings of sex addiction.

Neuroaffective science?studying the integrated development of the body, brain, and mind?has revealed
mechanisms linking psychological and biological factors of mental disorders, including addiction. Indeed, its
paradigm-shifting theoretical umbrella demonstrated that substance and behavioral dependencies share
identical neurobiological workings, and thus that problematic repetitive behaviors are genuine addictions?a
state increasingly understood as a chronic brain disorder. Clinical experience strongly suggests that sex
addiction (SA) treatment informed by affective neuroscience?the specialty of Alexandra Katehakis?proves
profoundly transformative.

Katehakis's relational protocol, presented here, blends neurobiology with psychology to accomplish full
recovery. Her Psychobiological Approach to Sex Addiction Treatment (PASAT) joins therapist and patient
through a relationally-based psychotherapy?a holistic, dyadic dance that calls on the body, brain, and mind
of both.

Written with clarity and compassion, this book integrates cutting-edge research, case studies, verbatim
session records, and patient writings and art. Katehakis explicates neurophysiological, psychological, and
cultural forces priming and maintaining SA, then details how her innovative treatment restores patients'
interpersonal, sexual, and spiritual relationality.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Knudsen:

The book Sex Addiction as Affect Dysregulation: A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton
Series on Interpersonal Neurobiology) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your
capable a lot more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting pressure or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make reading through a book Sex Addiction as Affect Dysregulation:
A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton Series on Interpersonal Neurobiology) to be your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about some
or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open up and read a reserve Sex Addiction as Affect
Dysregulation: A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton Series on Interpersonal
Neurobiology). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how
do you think about this guide?

Maria Tate:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this Sex Addiction as Affect Dysregulation: A
Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton Series on Interpersonal Neurobiology) book as
beginner and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Homer Smith:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title Sex Addiction as Affect
Dysregulation: A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton Series on Interpersonal
Neurobiology) suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Sex Addiction as Affect Dysregulation: A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton
Series on Interpersonal Neurobiology)is the main of several books that will everyone read now. This specific
book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lots of information about
this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Jesus Brewster:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can have



the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Sex Addiction as Affect
Dysregulation: A Neurobiologically Informed Holistic Treatment (Norton Series on Interpersonal
Neurobiology) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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