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From childhood, D.L. Mayfield longed to be a missionary, so she was thrilled when the opportunity arose to
work with a group of Somali Bantu refugees in her hometown of Portland, OR. As the days, months, and
years went by, her hopeful enthusiasm began to wear off, her faith became challenged, and the real work of
learning to love and serve her neighbors grew harder, deeper, and more complex. She writes: “The more I
failed to communicate the love of God to my refugee friends, the more I experienced it for myself. The more
overwhelmed I felt as I became involved in the myriads of problems facing my friends who experience
poverty in America, the less pressure I felt to attain success or wealth or prestige. And the more my world
started to expand at the edges of my periphery, the more it became clear that life was more beautiful and
more terrible than I had been told.”

In this collection of stunning and surprising essays, Mayfield invites readers to reconsider their concepts of
justice, love, and reimagine being a citizen of this world and the upside-down kingdom of God.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Pena:

The event that you get from Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith
will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get interested in
reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a
Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood through anyone who read it because the author of
this book is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it
is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose
you for having that Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith
instantly.

Stephanie Sellers:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone with everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously which
one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a Failed Missionary
on Rediscovering Faith as your daily resource information.

James Fong:

You could spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a
Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in the beach,
train in addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy
the particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Donna Hufnagel:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you
might have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific Assimilate or Go Home: Notes
from a Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at this
one book you have point that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of
book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend
doesn't understand, by knowing more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why
hesitate? We need to have Assimilate or Go Home: Notes from a Failed Missionary on Rediscovering Faith.
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