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THE REIGN OF THE GODS

For four years, he has ruled humanity with an iron fist. His enemies have been scattered or slain, though
some still fight on. He is Superman, the most powerful being in the world...but not in all worlds.

A stunning scheme has unleashed the Gods of Olympus on Earth, and they've seized the reins of power from
the Man of Steel. But though they have ended his tyranny—for now—the cure may be worse than the
disease. Now an unlikely alliance of friends and foes must fight to defeat these beings of indescribable magic
and might using every weapon at their disposal.

And they must not forget that they're not the only ones with weapons. Because if the war between gods and
heroes doesn't end soon, the nuclear-armed nations of Earth may all take aim together and end it once and for
all...

The endlessly surprising saga of superhero dystopia inspired by the hit video game continues! Writer Brian
Buccellato and artists Bruno Redondo, Mike S. Miller, Tom Derenick, and Xermanico conclude the Year of
the Gods in INJUSTICE: GODS AMONG US: YEAR FOUR VOL. 2, collecting INJUSTICE: GODS
AMONG US: YEAR FOUR #8-12 and INJUSTICE: GODS AMONG US: YEAR FOUR ANNUAL #1!

PLUS: Original writer Tom Taylor returns for an all-star super-villain jailbreak that leads directly into the
hotly anticipated YEAR FIVE!
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From reader reviews:

Stephan Partin:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Injustice: Gods Among Us:
Year Four (2015) Vol. 2 (Injustice: Gods Among Us (2013-2016)) book because this book offers you rich
details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it
everbody knows.

Jackie Gonzalez:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent 24 hours
a day to reading a e-book. The book Injustice: Gods Among Us: Year Four (2015) Vol. 2 (Injustice: Gods
Among Us (2013-2016)) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this
book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to deliver this
book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The
price is not to fund but this book features high quality.

Kimberly Spradlin:

You could spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Injustice: Gods Among Us: Year Four
(2015) Vol. 2 (Injustice: Gods Among Us (2013-2016)) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the
beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring typically the printed book, you can
buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Glenda Rogers:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update
of news. In this particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference
book, novel and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to
spread out your book? Or just seeking the Injustice: Gods Among Us: Year Four (2015) Vol. 2 (Injustice:
Gods Among Us (2013-2016)) when you needed it?
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