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This guided daily journal & undated diary has 202 pages (enough space for 100 days i.e. just over 3 months)
with daily prompts and a spacious two page spread per day with plenty of space for free writing and adding
your own image or drawing. The pages are undated so you can start your creative journey whenever you
wish. The journal is especially useful for reflection and idea generation as well as expressing gratitude. This
journal is essential for those who love the idea of prompts for inspiration but also want plenty of space for
freehand writing and drawing.

This is a perfect journal for a diary and is great for jotting down and planning your ideas or can be used as a
progress journal for all your ideas. and inspirations.

The journal has a soft yet sturdy cover and is perfect bound so pages will not fall out. The spacious, yet
handy-sized 7"x10" format means there is plenty of room for your thoughts and reflections.

Handy 7"x10" format.
202 pages for writing and reflection.
White Opaque Paper with grey/black lines.
Soft, sturdy cover.
Perfect bound so pages will not fall out.

Part of the  Inspirational Journal series with indian ink grunge cover design by Emilie Sabine - “Creative
Genius". Our notebooks all have an art cover or inspirational cover.

Other versions of this notebook are also available with a personal index and with 120 pages; also with other
art and inspirational covers.

To see our full range of notebooks and journals visit us at www.inspirationandart.co.uk or click on the
Amazon author link for Inspiration and Art Notebooks above.
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From reader reviews:

Lenore Ryan:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your condition; you can
add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202 Pages with
Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ... images,
drawings, doodles and free writing. Try to make book Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202
Pages with Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ...
images, drawings, doodles and free writing as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend
when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned
to suit your needs. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the
book. So , let's make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Aurelio Ashley:

The event that you get from Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202 Pages with Daily Prompts
Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ... images, drawings, doodles and
free writing is a more deep you searching the information that hide inside the words the more you get
considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but Inspiration & Gratitude
Guided Daily Journal 202 Pages with Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to
beat the blank page, ... images, drawings, doodles and free writing giving you thrill feeling of reading. The
article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through anyone who read that
because the author of this book is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own personal
vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We advise you for having this kind of Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202
Pages with Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ...
images, drawings, doodles and free writing instantly.

Larry Moore:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, or even playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent
24 hours a day to reading a e-book. The book Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202 Pages with
Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ... images,
drawings, doodles and free writing it is rather good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this
book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to bring this book you
can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your smart phone. The
price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.



Bruce Harrison:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202 Pages with Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day:
Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ... images, drawings, doodles and free writing your head will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will end
up your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a book then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get ahead of. The Inspiration & Gratitude Guided Daily Journal 202
Pages with Daily Prompts Two Page Spread per Day: Creative Genius journal to beat the blank page, ...
images, drawings, doodles and free writing giving you an additional experience more than blown away your
head but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you
the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished studying it, like
winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?
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