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Finalist for the 2014 Book Award for Excellence in the Study of Religion, textual studies category, presented
by the American Academy of Religion
Conceiving Identities explores how medieval Muslim theologians appropriate a woman s reproductive power
to construct a female gender identity in which maternity is a central component. Through a close analysis of
seventh- through fourteenth-century exegetical works, medical treatises, legal pronouncements,
historiographies, zoologies, and other literary materials, this study considers how medieval Muslim scholars
map the female reproductive body according to broader, cosmological schemes to generate a woman s role as
mother. By close consideration of folk medicine and magic, this book also reveals how medieval women
contest the traditional maternal identities imagined for them and thereby reinvent themselves as mothers and
Muslims. This innovative examination of the discourse and practices surrounding maternity forges new
ground as it takes up the historical and epistemic construction of medieval Muslim women s identities."
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From reader reviews:

Maurice Henkel:

Typically the book Conceiving Identities: Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse and Practice will bring
you to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In
case you try to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Conceiving Identities:
Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse and Practice is much recommended to you you just read. You can
also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Pearl Moore:

The reason why? Because this Conceiving Identities: Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse and Practice
is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you
with the secret this inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such
amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the
meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This
excellent book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book get such as help improving your proficiency
and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the
publication store hurriedly.

Ronald Tanaka:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-book
technique, more simple and reachable. This Conceiving Identities: Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse
and Practice can give you a lot of good friends because by you considering this one book you have thing that
they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This publication offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Conceiving
Identities: Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse and Practice.

William Luke:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Conceiving Identities: Maternity in Medieval Muslim Discourse and
Practice can make you sense more interested to read.
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