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Pontius Pilate is one of the Bible's best-known villains--but up until the tenth century, artistic imagery
appears to have consistently portrayed him as a benevolent Christian and holy symbol of baptism. For the
first time, Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art provides a complete look at the
shifting visual and textual representations of Pilate throughout early Christian and medieval art. Colum
Hourihane examines neglected and sometimes sympathetic portrayals, and shows how negative
characterizations of Pilate, which were developed for political and religious purposes, reveal the anti-
Semitism of the medieval period.

Hourihane indicates that in some artistic renderings, Pilate may have been a symbol of good, and in many, a
figure of jurisprudence. Eastern traditions treated Pilate as a saint with his own feast day, but Western
accounts from the tenth century changed him from a Roman to a Jew. Pilate became a vessel for anti-
Semitism--his image acquired grotesque facial and physical characteristics, and his role in Christ's Passion
grew to mythic proportions. By the fifteenth century, however, representations of Pilate came full circle to
depict an aged and empathetic administrator.

Combining a wealth of previously unpublished sources with explorations of art historical developments,
Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art puts forth for the first time an encyclopedic
portrait of a complex legend.
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From reader reviews:

Joel Faulkner:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval
Art. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important
any book Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art. You can add understanding and of
course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet
device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Carla McFarlin:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Pontius
Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art, you can tells your family, friends along with soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a publication.

John Gravatt:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short time to read it because this all time you only find publication that
need more time to be study. Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art can be your
answer given it can be read by an individual who have those short time problems.

Evelyn Rogers:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real their
interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Pontius Pilate, Anti-Semitism, and the Passion in Medieval Art can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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