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This book brings together for the first time five recent essays by Jacques Derrida, which advance his
reflections on many issues: lying, perjury, forgiveness, confession, the profession of faith, and, most
recently, cruelty, sovereignty, and capital punishment. Strongly linked by their attention to "performatives"
and the "as if," the essays show the necessity of thinking beyond the category of acts that are possible for a
subject. Derrida argues forcefully that thought must engage with the im-possible, that is, the order of the
unforeseeable event, the absolute future still to come. This acute awareness of the limits of performative
programs informs the essays throughout and attunes them closely to events of a world undergoing
"globalization."

The first essay, "History of the Lie," reviews some classic and modern definitions of the lie (Augustine,
Rousseau, Kant, Koyré, Arendt), while renewing questions about what is called lying, as distinguished from
other forms of nontruth. This inventive analysis is followed by "Typewriter Ribbon," which examines at
length the famous lie recounted by Rousseau in his Confessions, when he perjured himself by accusing
another of his own crime. Paul de Man's reading of this textual event is at the center of Derrida's patient, at
times seriously funny analyses. "Le parjure, Perhaps" engages with a remarkable novel by Henri Thomas
that fictionalizes the charge of perjury brought against Paul de Man in the 1950s. Derrida's extraordinary
fineness as a reader and thinker of fiction here treats, to profound effect, the "fatal experience of perjury."
The two final essays, "The University Without Condition" and "Psychoanalysis Searches the States of Its
Soul," address the institutions of the university and of psychoanalysis as sites from which to resist and
deconstruct the nontruth or phantasm of sovereignty. For the university, the principle of truth remains at the
core of its resistance; for psychoanalysis, there is the obligation to remain true to what may be, Derrida
suggests, its specific insight: into psychic cruelty. Resistance to the sovereign cruelty of the death penalty is
just one of the stakes indicated by the last essay, which is the text of a keynote address to the "States General
of Psychoanalysis" held in Paris, July 2000.

Especially for this volume, Derrida has written "Provocation: Forewords," which reflects on the title Without
Alibi while taking up questions about relations between deconstruction and America. This essay-foreword
also responds to the event of this book, which Peggy Kamuf in her introduction presents as event of
resistance. Without Alibi joins two other books by Derrida that Kamuf has translated for Stanford University
Press: Points . . .: Interviews, 1974-1994 (1994) and Resistances of Psychoanalysis (1998).
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From reader reviews:

Eddie Nelson:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Without Alibi (Meridian: Crossing
Aesthetics) book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Dione Wicker:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Without Alibi (Meridian: Crossing
Aesthetics) book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still skepticism Without Alibi (Meridian:
Crossing Aesthetics) as good book not merely by the cover but also by the content. This is one publication
that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick
that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to another
sixth sense.

Corey Mullen:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. That Without Alibi (Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics) can give
you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and make
anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success.
This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than some other
make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Without Alibi (Meridian:
Crossing Aesthetics).

Angeline Allison:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top book
for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of book Without Alibi
(Meridian: Crossing Aesthetics). You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it
could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about
book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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