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Think you know everything there is to know about the City of Splendors? Think again! Based on material
originally presented in FR1 Waterdeep and the North and City System, this box expands all that information
and adds over 200 pages of new characters, magic, and excitement! Here's what's inside: A 128-page
Campaign Guide with expanded city map keys and new information on every part of the city A 96-page
Who's Who, giving you details on the nobles and other NPCs of Waterdeep (over 100 new characters in this
book alone!) A 64-page Adventurer's Guide for players, with the Adventurers' Quarter, a new area of
Waterdeep complete with over 50 new NPCs A 16-page Secrets book, hiding the secrets of the NPCs and
adventures of the Adventurers' Quarter 6 poster maps, including new maps of the city and two photo maps of
the Adventurers' Quarter 16 Monstrous Compendium Appendix pages, with 13 never-before-seen monsters
to haunt the shadows of the city "Come explore the greatest city of the Realms in this compilation of
everything about the City of Splendors. From the spires of Piergeiron's Palace to the depths of
Undermountain, this city's sure to thrill players and Dungeon Masters alike for years.
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From reader reviews:

Jesus Novak:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important for us. The book City of Splendors (Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion) ended
up being making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is
quite advantages for you. The book City of Splendors (Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion) is not only
giving you far more new information but also for being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend
your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship together with the book City of
Splendors (Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion). You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read
some books.

Ryan Dewitt:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular City of Splendors
(Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion) book as beginner and daily reading e-book. Why, because this
book is greater than just a book.

Vincent Olson:

Exactly why? Because this City of Splendors (Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret that
inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such incredible way
makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly.
So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This amazing book
will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your
critical thinking means. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the book
store hurriedly.

Larry Huff:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
With the book City of Splendors (Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion) we can get more advantage. Don't
one to be creative people? To be creative person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book that
ideal with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book City of Splendors



(Forgotten Realms Campaign Expansion). You can more desirable than now.
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