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This quick-to-read guide offers an easy, seven-step overview on how you can become your own publisher
and publish books using Lightning Source as your printer, the top print-on-demand company for traditional
publishers, university presses, author services companies, and countless micro-publishers just like you.  
Inside you will find: • A 7-step guide to publishing your own book using print-on-demand printing via
Lightning Source or IngramSpark;   • Cost evaluation worksheets to monitor your profit,   • Frequently asked
questions answer guide,  • Reference list, and marketing tips Why allow a publisher to gobble 94% of your
hard earned profits, when you could be pocketing 30%, 40%, 50%, or more? Why sit on your hands with lost
sales while you wait for up to two years for your book to hit the shelves? Should you allow an online print
provider to dictate your pricing and wholesale discounts when you can be in control of how much you earn?
Shouldn’t YOU be in charge of your book’s design and destiny?  For nearly two decades, designer,
consultant, and print-on-demand specialist, Jamie L. Saloff, has walked countless authors through each phase
of the publishing process, guiding them every step of the way as they publish Profitable Print Products.™
Saloff has guided men, women, talented teens, gen Xers, baby boomers, golden agers, and even
posthumously published authors — regardless of technical ability — through these 7 easy-to-do steps.  If you
are tired of waiting for a traditional publisher to find you, have tried online publishing services and were
dissatisfied, or are ready to go it alone but want to ensure your book will look professional and be available
in a global market, the advice in this book will be of value to you.  What Others Are Saying: “In her calm,
caring, unhurried manner, Jamie will conscientiously lead you through self-publishing’s rather arduous
challenges with gentle, ingenious expertness. She is perhaps the most capable person working in the self-
publishing industry, and her gift is helping people.” Perry Foster, author of “Hands Upon My Heart: My
Journey Through Heart Disease and Into Life.” “My book sales are going up every day. I have sold almost
1000 copies… I can hardly keep up with it all, though it’s very exciting.” Patricia Kyritsi Howell, author of
“Medicinal Plants of the Southern Appalachians” “Partially as a result of Jamie’s efforts and sound advice, I
save thousands of dollars a year and my corporation’s income has nearly doubled. This wouldn’t have
happened without her.” Tom Bird, author and “Write Your Book in a Weekend” retreat leader
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From reader reviews:

Walter Gagne:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are reading
whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this 7 Easy Steps to Professionally Self-Publish Your Book Using
Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A Quick Reference Guide for Creating Print-On-Demand Book.

John Lee:

7 Easy Steps to Professionally Self-Publish Your Book Using Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A Quick
Reference Guide for Creating Print-On-Demand Book can be one of your nice books that are good idea.
Many of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your
knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
author giving his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing 7 Easy Steps to
Professionally Self-Publish Your Book Using Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A Quick Reference Guide
for Creating Print-On-Demand Book nevertheless doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest
along with based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can
certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Joe Dix:

This 7 Easy Steps to Professionally Self-Publish Your Book Using Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A
Quick Reference Guide for Creating Print-On-Demand Book is completely new way for you who has
curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon it
getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this 7
Easy Steps to Professionally Self-Publish Your Book Using Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A Quick
Reference Guide for Creating Print-On-Demand Book can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books develop itself in the form and
that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in guide
form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a reserve
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss that! Just
read this e-book variety for your better life and knowledge.

Anthony Bankston:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know



everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This publication 7 Easy Steps to Professionally Self-Publish Your Book
Using Lightning Source or Ingramspark: A Quick Reference Guide for Creating Print-On-Demand Book was
filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you
can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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