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Is it possible to reconcile mathematics, philosophy, psychology, science, art, spirituality and religion? A few
years ago this would have seemed impossible. However, in the years to come, this could become a reality.
We are living in the midst of an uncertain, crucial and exciting period in human history. During the last few
decades, science has undergone a radical transformation. The discovery of fractal geometry, holography,
quantum and Chaos theory has completely altered our vision of the universe. Today, the universe appears to
be more a dramatic, meaningful and purposeful work of art than an agglomeration of parts governed by
deterministic laws. Many years ago, the philosopher, scientist and theologian Emanuel Swedenborg had
already obtained a new paradigm of the universe that reconciles all aspects of human existence. In this book,
the author demonstrates how the latest discoveries of mathematics, philosophy and science corroborate what
Swedenborg already saw more than 200 years ago.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Rohan:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Love, Order & Chaos: The Universe as a Fractal whose
Strange Attractor is Divine Love. Try to stumble through book Love, Order & Chaos: The Universe as a
Fractal whose Strange Attractor is Divine Love as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when
you feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your
case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , we
should make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Clara Bearden:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice simply by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this specific Love, Order & Chaos:
The Universe as a Fractal whose Strange Attractor is Divine Love book as starter and daily reading e-book.
Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Leonard Bartow:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a
book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to reading
a guide. The book Love, Order & Chaos: The Universe as a Fractal whose Strange Attractor is Divine Love
it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people
were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the
actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too costly
but this book has high quality.

Gloria Quinones:

Love, Order & Chaos: The Universe as a Fractal whose Strange Attractor is Divine Love can be one of your
basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good
vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still
delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing
Love, Order & Chaos: The Universe as a Fractal whose Strange Attractor is Divine Love although doesn't



forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you
can be certainly one of it. This great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial
pondering.
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