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Now available in paperback, Arroz con leche / Rice Pudding is the second title of Jorge Argueta’s popular
bilingual Cooking Poems series, celebrating the joys of preparing, eating and sharing food.

From sprinkling the rice into the pot, to adding a waterfall of milk, cinnamon sticks, salt stars and sugar
snow, Jorge Argueta’s recipe is not only easy to follow, it is a poetic experience. The lively illustrations by
Fernando Vilela feature an enthusiastic young cook who finds no end of joy in making and then slurping up
the rice pudding with his family.

As in all the titles in this series, Arroz con leche / Rice Pudding conveys the pleasure of making something
delicious to eat for people you really love. A great book for families to enjoy together.
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From reader reviews:

Janice Oconnell:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice through surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up
than other is high. In your case who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Arroz con leche
/ Rice Pudding: Un poema para cocinar / A Cooking Poem (Bilingual Cooking Poems) book as starter and
daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Miranda Wenger:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading routine give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge your
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books
but if you want truly feel happy read one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The
particular Arroz con leche / Rice Pudding: Un poema para cocinar / A Cooking Poem (Bilingual Cooking
Poems) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Virgil Santamaria:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this Arroz
con leche / Rice Pudding: Un poema para cocinar / A Cooking Poem (Bilingual Cooking Poems).

Lisa Williams:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Arroz con leche / Rice Pudding: Un
poema para cocinar / A Cooking Poem (Bilingual Cooking Poems) guide written by well-known writer who
really knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written
throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger
then you still hesitation Arroz con leche / Rice Pudding: Un poema para cocinar / A Cooking Poem
(Bilingual Cooking Poems) as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is one
publication that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick



this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an
additional sixth sense.
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