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The goal of this book is to provide law students with an understanding of the major federal civil rights
statutes. We begin with the Reconstruction Era laws, passed shortly after the Civil War, that remain an
important part of the civil rights landscape even after Congress enacted additional statutes, beginning with
the Civil Rights Act of 1964. The materials include Titles II and VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, the Age
Discrimination in Employment Act, the Americans with Disabilities Act, and the Equal Pay Act, as well as
three federal funding statutes that prohibit discrimination-the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, Title VI of the
Civil Rights Act of 1964, and Title IX of the Education Amendments of 1972. Some of the statutes overlap
and we explore the advantages and disadvantages of each, looking at the enforcement options, remedies,
including damages and attorney fees, defenses, and limitations on the power of Congress to pass such acts.
More than thirty problems provide the students with an opportunity to apply the statutes they study. About
the authors: The authors, Rosalie Berger Levinson and Ivan E. Bodensteiner, have taught a civil rights
course, as well as Constitutional Law, for many years and have several years of experience litigating civil
rights claims. They are the authors of a five-volume civil rights treatise, which is supplemented annually.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Reese:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This Civil Rights Legislation and
Litigation, Second Edition 2013 is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Mary Sylvester:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read a book.
It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the whole day to
reading a reserve. The book Civil Rights Legislation and Litigation, Second Edition 2013 it is very good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. If you
did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read
this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Jose Batey:

Beside this particular Civil Rights Legislation and Litigation, Second Edition 2013 in your phone, it could
possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge
you will got here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow
town. It is good thing to have Civil Rights Legislation and Litigation, Second Edition 2013 because this book
offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this
book as well as read it from currently!

Walter Knight:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when they get a
half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book Civil Rights Legislation and Litigation, Second
Edition 2013 to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing
when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the opinion
about book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and
learn it. Beside that the e-book Civil Rights Legislation and Litigation, Second Edition 2013 can to be your
new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of the time.
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