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Amos Nordquist didn't start out to be a minister, much less one in the American Civil War. Strong,
handsome, intelligent, and wealthy, he intended to eventually head Nordquist Shipping, the Swedish
shipping company begun by his father, Stig Nordquist, decades earlier. A devastating storm at sea, however,
destroys two Nordquist ships and all but a few crewmen, one of whom was Amos. Floating in a lifeboat on
the North Atlantic, Amos has an epiphany and determines that if he survives, he will "do the Lord's work,"
although at that moment he is unsure of what God might have planned.

Circumstances bring him to America, and But Now I See, the first book in the To Sing God's Praise trilogy,
begins with Pastor Nordquist, "the big preacher," in Murray, Idaho, the last major Old West gold strike,
where he befriends Angus MacGregor, a burly prospector with a penchant for Scotch and an insatiable
interest in all things spiritual. Angus asks how a Swedish pastor winds up in Murray, and the reader hears the
story, including the hurricane, the lifeboat, the decision, a seeming betrayal, the Russians, the Einar II arson,
the intruder, coming to America to find an uncle, and serving under Gen. George Custer at Sailor's Creek and
Appomattox.

Following the war, Nordquist heads north with "Fatha Abraham" Cole, a self-educated former slave intent on
teaching other former slaves, and the reader gets an education in antebellum slavery. Nordquist settles in
Minnesota where he meets his beautiful wife, Anna, and the reader experiences their challenges as they have
children, plant churches and schools, and minister in rural hinterlands.

But Now I See does three things: as with all good novels, it entertains, but it also teaches and edifies, making
the reader hungry for more, the time well spent.
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From reader reviews:

James Stover:

This book untitled But Now I See: Book 1 of to Sing God's Praise: A Journey in Three Parts to be one of
several books that will best seller in this year, this is because when you read this book you can get a lot of
benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it by using online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

John Carter:

But Now I See: Book 1 of to Sing God's Praise: A Journey in Three Parts can be one of your basic books that
are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase
your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The
writer giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing But Now I See: Book 1
of to Sing God's Praise: A Journey in Three Parts nevertheless doesn't forget the main place, giving the
reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be considered one of it. This
great information may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial pondering.

Karla Walker:

The book untitled But Now I See: Book 1 of to Sing God's Praise: A Journey in Three Parts contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very straightforward all
the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by famous author. The
author will take you in the new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can keep
reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy
the e-book, you can open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.

Cindy Gross:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This But Now I See: Book 1 of to Sing
God's Praise: A Journey in Three Parts is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often the e-
book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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