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Shop, Save, and Share is a streamlined program to help you save hundreds of dollars a month on groceries
and household supplies and have a bounty to share with people in need. While the Food Economic Review
says the average family of seven spends nearly $1000 a month on food, Ellie Kay spends only $200 a month
for the same items plus diapers, toiletries, and cleansers. And in one year she donated over $1000 in
groceries to needy families!

Using the simple principles of Shop, Save, and Share, most households can lower their food budgets 50% to
85% under national norms. A smashing success on 120 Air Forces bases worldwide, Ellie Kay's Shop, Save,
and Share presentation has been made available to more than half a million people.

"Ellie Kay's tips were conceived in shoe leather walking the aisles of the supermarkets and shops of the city.
Shop, Save, and Share will definitely save you big bucks and point the way to sharing your secrets with
others."

Pastor Jack D. Brock, Senior Pastor, Christ Community Church

"Ellie Kay's book challenges families to take charge of their finances, simplify their lives, reassess their
priorities, and share with others who are less fortunate. Her simple yet revolutionary program changes
families daily."

MG Lawson W. Magruder III, Commanding General, U.S. Army

"One evening with this extremely practical book will change your whole approach to balancing income and
expenses. On
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Henderson:

The feeling that you get from Shop, Save, Share could be the more deep you looking the information that
hide inside the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Shop, Save, Share giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point
in selected way that can be understood through anyone who read that because the author of this guide is
well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose
you for having this particular Shop, Save, Share instantly.

Christopher Larsen:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the guide untitled Shop, Save, Share can be great book to read. May be it may be best activity
to you.

Doreen Wolf:

You could spend your free time to see this book this book. This Shop, Save, Share is simple bringing you can
read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the
book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Jessica Seymore:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Shop, Save, Share can be the reply, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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