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Avoid costly mistakes and create more profit by writing a strategic book. A strategic book acts like a
brochure or business card on steroids. So don't waste time selling your book, let your book sell you! The
Seven Secrets of Successful Authors is the first step towards planning, publishing, and productising your
strategic book correctly, so that it becomes a laser-focussed marketing tool that gives you more clarity,
credibility, and collateral. The book describes a simple foolproof system for writing a book, with every step
already planned and mapped out in detail for you to follow? The Seven Secrets of Successful Authors
exposes a simple process to get your knowledge, skills and expertise out of your head and into print sooner
than you ever imagined possible. The author has worked with many business-owners, entrepreneurs and
specialists who aspired to become successful authors in their fields of expertise. They're people who wanted
to increase their credibility FAST and stand head and shoulders above their competitors. Successful authors
use a simple ABC framework to write a Strategic Book: • Achieve Strategic Clarity. Planning a clear
strategic direction gives focus. • Boost Personal Credibility. Publishing a Strategic Book enhances your
personal reputation. • Create Profitable Collateral. Productising creates profit from your existing skills and
knowledge by creating collateral that attracts pre-sold prospects who want to become customers. The Seven
Secrets of Successful Authors was written to support authors through the first part of the ABC framework.
Here is what you'll discover inside: Secret 1: WHAT to write about Secret 2: WHO to write for Secret 3:
WHY your readers buy books Secret 4: HOW to design your book Secret 5: WHEN to finish writing Secret
6: WHERE to promote your book Secret 7: WHICH specialists to use
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From reader reviews:

John Wannamaker:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that guide
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this The Seven Secrets of Successful Authors: A Proven
System for Writing a Strategic Book That Avoids Costly Mistakes and Creates More Profit!.

Selma Lang:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this The Seven Secrets of Successful
Authors: A Proven System for Writing a Strategic Book That Avoids Costly Mistakes and Creates More
Profit! book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation The Seven Secrets of Successful
Authors: A Proven System for Writing a Strategic Book That Avoids Costly Mistakes and Creates More
Profit! as good book not merely by the cover but also from the content. This is one guide that can break don't
assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on
your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Donald Fujita:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of book The
Seven Secrets of Successful Authors: A Proven System for Writing a Strategic Book That Avoids Costly
Mistakes and Creates More Profit!. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most important that,
you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Gerardo Roney:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual.
From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just looking for the The Seven Secrets of Successful Authors: A Proven System for Writing a
Strategic Book That Avoids Costly Mistakes and Creates More Profit! when you essential it?
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