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For South Koreans, the twenty years from the early 1960s to late 1970s were the best and worst of times?a
period of unprecedented economic growth and of political oppression that deepened as prosperity spread. In
this masterly account, Carter J. Eckert finds the roots of South Korea’s dramatic socioeconomic
transformation in the country’s long history of militarization?a history personified in South Korea’s
paramount leader, Park Chung Hee.

The first volume of a comprehensive two-part history, Park Chung Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of
Militarism, 1866–1945 reveals how the foundations of the dynamic but strongly authoritarian Korean state
that emerged under Park were laid during the period of Japanese occupation. As a cadet in the Manchurian
Military Academy, Park and his fellow officers absorbed the Imperial Japanese Army’s ethos of victory at all
costs and absolute obedience to authority. Japanese military culture decisively shaped Korea’s postwar
generation of military leaders. When Park seized power in an army coup in 1961, he brought this training
and mentality to bear on the project of Korean modernization.

Korean society under Park exuded a distinctively martial character, Eckert shows. Its hallmarks included the
belief that the army should intervene in politics in times of crisis; that a central authority should plan and
monitor the country’s economic system; that the Korean people’s “can do” spirit would allow them to
overcome any challenge; and that the state should maintain a strong disciplinary presence in society,
reserving the right to use violence to maintain order.
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From reader reviews:

Marlene Childs:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When
you read this Park Chung Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of Militarism, 1866-1945, you can tells your
family, friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a
publication.

Earnestine Marcus:

The book untitled Park Chung Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of Militarism, 1866-1945 contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains her idea with easy way. The language is very easy to understand
all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled by famous author.
The author provides you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can
please read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a
nice study.

Rachel Robbins:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of book Park Chung
Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of Militarism, 1866-1945. You can contribute your knowledge by it.
Without leaving behind the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.

Jimmy Stansberry:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book Park Chung Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of
Militarism, 1866-1945 to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is
developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to learn it and
mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to
wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the book Park Chung Hee and Modern Korea: The Roots of
Militarism, 1866-1945 can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse in
doing what must you're doing of that time.
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