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If you are learning Lingala, this book was not created for you, and you should not purchase it. It was created
for completely fluent mother-tongue speakers of Lingala who already know the full meaning of Lingala
words, but who need to learn how a single English translation of a Lingala word may have ambiguous
meanings in the English language. It is designed for bi-lingual education for the non-English reader who
wants to improve English-language test scores covering English synonyms. Synonyms may bear no
relationship to a translation word (e.g. “love” can signify both an emotion and a score of zero in tennis; zero,
while being a synonym of love, is likely to be a bad translation to the original Lingala headword). This is a
regular English thesaurus, like Roget’s, but the entries are sorted alphabetically using headwords from
Lingala. It cannot be used to translate between the two languages, but may help a fluent speaker of Lingala
who is learning basic English, to learn the ambiguities of the English language and its vocabulary. The
synonyms for each headword are not translations; Lingala words are used to facilitate “looking up” English
synonyms. Prior to purchase, educators and students should review the contents of this unique form of
thesaurus which is free to view on Google books, or using Amazon’s “look inside” function. Public domain
translations used were contributed to Webster’s Online Dictionary and have originated from uncited
volunteers, native speakers, professional translators, field linguists and academics (not by the editor of the
thesaurus). If you would like citation for any translations, make suggestions, note errors, or contribute in any
other way, please email Philip M. Parker at INSEAD, who will periodically update this series. Reproduction
rights are granted to educators.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Nehring:

The publication with title Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary posesses a lot of information
that you can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new
information the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you inside new
era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere
you want.

Leon Fisher:

The book Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom makes some
research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading
this book.

John Casteel:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to do
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books
in the top checklist in your reading list will be Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary. This book
that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By
looking way up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Sean Ward:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we
know those ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around
the world. By book Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary we can consider more advantage.
Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Only choose the
best book that ideal with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Webster's
Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary. You can more inviting than now.

Download and Read Online Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus



Dictionary Philip M. Parker #IQ6TDRUYZ9M



Read Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip
M. Parker for online ebook

Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books,
books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub,
read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books
to read Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker books to read online.

Online Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker ebook
PDF download

Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker Doc

Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker Mobipocket

Webster's Lingala - English Thesaurus Dictionary by Philip M. Parker EPub


