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Beginning with the apostles themselves, Christians have practiced the art of telling their stories to bring
others to faith. Leonard J. DeLorenzo, theology professor and director of Notre Dame Vision--a program
designed to help youth and young adults find their true vocation--presents seven guiding principles to help
you share your faith in a genuine way and teach others to do so as well.

Unlike many evangelical Christians, Catholics often find it difficult to tell their faith stories. Leonard
DeLorenzo has taught thousands of teens and young adults to relate their moments of grace in a way that is
compelling, convincing, and free of clichés and vague generalizations.

His seven guiding principles are:

Tell it as a story●

Begin with what happened●

Express it in style●

Modify it for your audience●

Ensure there is sufficient closure●

Embrace natural emotions and●

Pray and practice●

DeLorenzo includes literary examples of writers such as C. S. Lewis and Flannery O'Connor, the conversion
stories of St. Paul and St. Augustine, and real-life accounts of grace told by young adults he's worked with.
Their stories are born out of battling an anxiety disorder, struggling with a loved one's Alzheimer's disease,
dealing with the effects of alcoholism, learning from people with mental disabilities, and overcoming an
eating disorder. DeLorenzo teaches us that by paying close attention to particular aspects of these stories, we
can attune ourselves to the surprising and specific ways that grace moved through their experiences--as it
does in our own. DeLorenzo provides a model for the kind of attentiveness we should foster when crafting
our own stories of grace, and lead others to do so by providing an example of God's presence in our everyday
life.

Witness is a unique resource for faith-formation ministers and adults of all ages to appreciate the ways that
grace is at work in your life, to inspire hope, and to build community by telling your own faith story.
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From reader reviews:

Eva Stanfield:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Witness: Learning to
Tell the Stories of Grace That Illumine Our Lives book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because
this book is more than just a book.

Brandon Macdonald:

This Witness: Learning to Tell the Stories of Grace That Illumine Our Lives is great publication for you
because the content which is full of information for you who have always deal with world and have to make
decision every minute. That book reveal it info accurately using great plan word or we can say no rambling
sentences within it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean
it only provides straight forward sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences.
Having Witness: Learning to Tell the Stories of Grace That Illumine Our Lives in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with
ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful
do you still doubt in which?

Shawn Young:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This Witness: Learning to Tell the Stories of Grace That Illumine Our
Lives can give you a lot of good friends because by you looking at this one book you have matter that they
don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you
to get success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing
more than additional make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have Witness: Learning to Tell
the Stories of Grace That Illumine Our Lives.

Bernice Cofield:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose typically the book Witness: Learning to Tell the Stories of
Grace That Illumine Our Lives to make your current reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of
reading skill is developing when you including reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you
enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like
to open a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book Witness: Learning to Tell the Stories of Grace That



Illumine Our Lives can to be your new friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must
you're doing of that time.
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