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Mathematics is one of humanity's most successful yet puzzling endeavors. It is a model of precision and
objectivity, but appears distinct from the empirical sciences because it seems to deliver nonexperiential
knowledge of a nonphysical reality of numbers, sets, and functions. How can these two aspects of
mathematics be reconciled? This concise book provides a systematic yet accessible introduction to the field
that is trying to answer that question: the philosophy of mathematics.

Written by Øystein Linnebo, one of the world's leading scholars on the subject, the book introduces all of the
classical approaches to the field, including logicism, formalism, intuitionism, empiricism, and structuralism.
It also contains accessible introductions to some more specialized issues, such as mathematical intuition,
potential infinity, the iterative conception of sets, and the search for new mathematical axioms. The
groundbreaking work of German mathematician and philosopher Gottlob Frege, one of the founders of
analytic philosophy, figures prominently throughout the book. Other important thinkers whose work is
introduced and discussed include Immanuel Kant, John Stuart Mill, David Hilbert, Kurt Gödel, W. V. Quine,
Paul Benacerraf, and Hartry H. Field.

Sophisticated but clear and approachable, this is an essential introduction for all students and teachers of
philosophy, as well as mathematicians and others who want to understand the foundations of mathematics.
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From reader reviews:

Karla Whisenant:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for us. The book Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of
Contemporary Philosophy) has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can
take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The guide Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton
Foundations of Contemporary Philosophy) is not only giving you more new information but also to be your
friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make
relationship with all the book Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of Contemporary
Philosophy). You never sense lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Virginia Glass:

The knowledge that you get from Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of Contemporary
Philosophy) may be the more deep you searching the information that hide in the words the more you get
enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Philosophy of
Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of Contemporary Philosophy) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The
copy writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by means of anyone who read it
because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your vocabulary
increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We highly recommend you for having this Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of
Contemporary Philosophy) instantly.

Paul Leavens:

The e-book with title Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of Contemporary Philosophy) has a
lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist
new information the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you
within new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the
idea anywhere you want.

Pamela Stanley:

The book untitled Philosophy of Mathematics (Princeton Foundations of Contemporary Philosophy) contain
a lot of information on it. The writer explains the woman idea with easy approach. The language is very clear
to see all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous
author. The author will take you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can
read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a



nice read.
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